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Fragonard's playful paintings is the first critical analysis of the function of play as an artistic concept and
visual experience in Rococo art. The art of Jean-Honoré Fragonard embodies the pervasive culture of play in
eighteenth-century France. His interactive paintings and drawings invite beholders to engage in a visual
game of interpretation through subject, form and theme. This book not only examines Fragonard's art
through close analyses of individual works, but also considers the role of the viewer within a variety of
contexts related to social behaviour, philosophy, literature and aesthetics. More than any other artist from the
period, Fragonard produced images of play that evidence the ludic impulses of ancien-régime thought and
expose the underlying significance of eighteenth-century frivolity.

Focused on bringing students and specialists closer to works of art, the book addresses what we see in order
to understand better how paintings about play can stimulate playful ideas through dynamic exchanges
between artist, image and beholder.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Jones:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby per other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't wish do
that. You must know how great along with important the book Fragonards playful paintings: Visual games in
rococo art (Critical Perspectives in Art History MUP). All type of book are you able to see on many
methods. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Annette Dixon:

This book untitled Fragonards playful paintings: Visual games in rococo art (Critical Perspectives in Art
History MUP) to be one of several books that best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read
this e-book you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retail
outlet or you can order it by means of online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to your
account to past this reserve from your list.

Willie Adams:

The particular book Fragonards playful paintings: Visual games in rococo art (Critical Perspectives in Art
History MUP) has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of
advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research just
before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after scanning
this book.

Jonathan Rodriguez:

Beside this specific Fragonards playful paintings: Visual games in rococo art (Critical Perspectives in Art
History MUP) in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info.
The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from oven so don't be worry if you feel
like an older people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have Fragonards playful paintings: Visual
games in rococo art (Critical Perspectives in Art History MUP) because this book offers to you personally
readable information. Do you often have book but you do not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that
will not end up to happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable,
just like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the item? Find this book and also read it from
currently!
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