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Izzy Malone, a spunky girl who wants to be part of an elite rowing club, must first attend a very unique
charm school in this first novel of a brand-new duology from the author of Seeing Cinderella and Plastic
Polly.

Izzy Malone isn’t your typical sixth grader. She wears camouflage combat boots and tie dye skirts; the Big
Dipper and Orion are her two best friends; and she’d rather climb trees or shoot hoops than talk about boys
and makeup. And after only a month of middle school she’s already set the record for the most trips to the
Principal’s office.

The only time Izzy feels at peace is when she’s on the open water, and more than anything else, she wants to
become a member of the Dandelion Paddlers, her school’s competitive rowing club. But thanks to those
multiple trips to the Principal’s office, Izzy’s parents force her to enroll in Mrs. Whippie’s Charm School, a
home-study course in manners and etiquette, or they won’t let her race in the Dandelion Falls annual
pumpkin regatta—where Izzy hopes to prove to the Dandelion Paddlers she is more than qualified to be on
their team.

When Mrs. Whippie’s first letter arrives it’s way different from what Izzy was expecting. Tucked inside the
letter is a shiny gold bracelet and an envelope charm. Izzy must earn her first charm by writing someone a
nice note, and once she does more tasks will be assigned.

Izzy manages to complete some of the tasks—and to her surprise, she actually finds herself enjoying the
course. But when one of her attempts at doing something good is misinterpreted, she fears her chances at
passing the course—and becoming a Paddler—are slipping away. With some unexpected friends there to
support her, can Izzy manage to earn her charms and stay true to herself?
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From reader reviews:

Clifford Ranger:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of many ways to
share the information or their idea. Second, looking at a book will make anyone more imaginative. When
you reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story
how the character types do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to some others. When
you read this The Charming Life of Izzy Malone, you may tells your family, friends and also soon about
yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a reserve.

Ronnie Hamilton:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the free time or they will get
large amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity
do you possess when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will certainly unlimited right.
Then ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the book you
have read is usually The Charming Life of Izzy Malone.

Leigh Grayer:

This The Charming Life of Izzy Malone is new way for you who has fascination to look for some
information since it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you
know or you who still having little digest in reading this The Charming Life of Izzy Malone can be the light
food for you personally because the information inside this particular book is easy to get through anyone.
These books develop itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book web form.
People who think that in book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there isn't
any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for an
individual. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and also knowledge.

Stacie Schneider:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. That The Charming Life of Izzy Malone can give you a lot of
close friends because by you checking out this one book you have factor that they don't and make you more
like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success. This publication
offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make you to be
great folks. So , why hesitate? We need to have The Charming Life of Izzy Malone.
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